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  Karshi branch of TIIAME organized an interview for admitting
applicants to the branch for correspondence courses for the
2021-2022 academic year on the recommendation of
ministries, departments and large business associations.
    It is important to suggest that there are several Resolutions of the State Commission for Admission to
Educational Institutions of the Republic of Uzbekistan dated No. 2, July 20, 2021 and the Ministry of Higher
and Secondary Specialized Education of the Republic of Uzbekistan, dated October 6, 2021. In order to
ensure the implementation of the tasks set in letter No. 3634 in  Karshi branch of TIIAME for 2021-2022
academic  year,  the  interview  for  admitting  applicants  in  the  form  of  distance  learning  with  the
recommendation of ministries, departments and large business of the association, the Commission began
work on October 19, 2021. The chairman of the commission, director of the Branch Z. Mukimov said that at
a meeting of the State Commission for admission to educational institutions of the Republic of Uzbekistan
on July 4, 2019, to familiarize citizens with work experience of at least five years concurrently. The evening
training based on the results of an interview on the basis of a differentiated service payment agreement
”According to him, the results of the interview will be assessed on a 100-point scale, and the qualification
point will be 55 points. During the interview, he noted that applicants, who have a recommendation will
have  general  knowledge  about  the  field,  in  which  they  work,  their  job  responsibilities,  the  purpose  of
acccepting to higher education. The branch announced that a meeting of the commission for admitting
applicants for extramural education and determining its results has been opened.
  

The executive secretary of the selection committee D. Kuvvatov invited the applicants to the hall for an
interview. The executive secretary of the selection committee D. Kuvvatov spoke at the meeting of the
branch director on October 11, 2021 with a report "On the admission of applicants with a recommendation
for  the 2021/2022 academic year in the form of  distance learning"317A /  F  on the approval  of  the
composition of the commission (Appendix 1). To participate in the work of the survey commission, the
head of the economic department of Surkhandarya water supply LLC Kh.Buryev, chief engineer E. Boltaev,
head of the personnel department of Kashkadarya water supply LLC Sh. Bekmurodova, chief dispatcher G.
Buryev. The branch was visited by the head of the personnel department of SE "Kasan" Sh. Burkhanov, the
first  deputy  head  of  the  Kashkadarya  regional  statistical  department  S.  Safarov  and  the  head  of  the
personnel  department  of  LLC  "Kashkadarya  agroservice  MTP"  F.  Toshtemirova.

  The candidates were introduced to the assessment criteria and interview procedures, and the interview
process  began  after  preparation.  Applicants  answered  questions  from  members  of  the  interview
committee. The members of the commission assessed the applicants' answers to the questions posed. The
executive secretary of the selection committee D. Kuvvatov announced the end of the interview and said
that the results of the interview would be announced by the applicant in the near future. Interview with the
chairman and members of the commission for the 2021-2022 academic year. Calculated the average score
for the year and published the opinion of the commission. According to the commission, all applicants
recommended by  the  ministry,  departments  and  large  business  associations  were  recommended to
students and expressed confidence that they will  become professionals in their  field and make a worthy
contribution to the development of the industry.
 Karshi branch of TIIAME organized the conversation on the admission of applicants for the 2021-2022
academic year with the recommendation of ministries, departments and large business associations for
training in the distance learning industry in the Republic of Uzbekistan Statement No. 2 of the meeting of
the State Commission on admission to educational institutions dated July 20, 2021 and by letter of the
Ministry of Higher and Secondary Specialized Education of the Republic of Uzbekistan No. 02 / 15-4 /
1-3634 dated October 06, 2021. in order to ensure the fulfillment of the tasks set in the Karshi branch of
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TIIAME.  The  Interview  with  the  admission  commission  for  the  2021-2022  academic  year  with  the
recommendation of  ministries,  departments  and large business  associations  in  the  form of  distance
learning October 19, 2021 working  in that sphere. The chairman of the commission, director of the branch
Z. Mukimov addressed the audience.


